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welcome to  

Bere Road, Elmswell Bury St. Edmunds 

This charming, detached house in Elmswell boasts 7 years of NHBC warranty. Features include an entrance hall, cloakroom, living room with bay 

windows, open-plan kitchen/dining with French doors, 4 bedrooms (master en-suite), family bathroom, spacious garden, car port, and off-road 

parking. 

   

   



 

 

 

 
view this property online  williamhbrown.co.uk/Property/SMK104310 

 

Location 

Elmswell is a charming village located in the county 
of Suffolk, England, known for its rural beauty and 
community spirit. Situated amidst the picturesque 
Suffolk countryside, Elmswell offers a tranquil escape 
from the hustle and bustle of urban life. 
 
The village of Elmswell is characterised by its quaint 
cottages, historic buildings, and scenic landscapes, 
providing residents with a peaceful and idyllic setting 
to call home. The village centre features a mix of 
local shops, traditional pubs, and community 
facilities, fostering a close-knit and welcoming 
atmosphere. 
 
Elmswell boasts a rich history, with historical sites 
and landmarks that offer a glimpse into the village's 
past. Residents and visitors can explore the 
surrounding countryside, with walking trails and 
green spaces that showcase the natural beauty of 
Suffolk. 
 
Despite its rural setting, Elmswell is well-connected 
to nearby towns and cities, providing residents with 
easy access to a range of amenities and services. The 
village's location offers a perfect balance of 
countryside living and convenience, making it an 
attractive destination for those seeking a peaceful 
and picturesque lifestyle. 
 
Overall, Elmswell, Suffolk, is a charming village that 
embodies the quintessential English countryside 
charm. With its tranquil setting, community spirit, 
and natural beauty, Elmswell provides a welcoming 
and serene environment for residents to enjoy the 
best of rural living in Suffolk. 
 

 

Description 

Nestled in the charming village of Elmswell, this 
delightful detached house is an ideal family home, 
complete with 7 years remaining on its NHBC 
warranty for peace of mind. Upon entering, you are 
greeted by a welcoming entrance hall that sets the 
tone for the rest of the property. 

 
The ground floor features a convenient downstairs 
cloakroom, perfect for guests. The living room is a 
standout space, boasting elegant bay windows that 
flood the room with natural light, creating a warm 
and inviting atmosphere. The heart of the home is 
the spacious open-plan integrated kitchen and 
dining area, designed for modern living and 
entertaining. This area seamlessly flows out through 
French doors to the rear garden, allowing for a 
perfect indoor-outdoor living experience. A separate 
utility room adds practicality, providing additional 
storage and workspace. 
 
Venturing upstairs, you will find four well-
proportioned bedrooms, including a master suite 
with a private en-suite bathroom, offering a serene 
retreat for relaxation. The family bathroom serves the 
other bedrooms, ensuring ample facilities for family 
and guests alike. 
 
Externally, the property boasts a generous rear 
garden that is perfect for outdoor gatherings, 
featuring both a patio area for al fresco dining and a 
decking area for lounging in the sun. Side access 
leads to a convenient car port, with off-road parking 
available at the front of the house, ensuring ample 
space for vehicles. 
 
This home perfectly combines modern convenience 
with the charm of village life, making it an 
exceptional opportunity for those seeking a 
comfortable and stylish residence in Elmswell. 
 

Entrance Porch 

Part glazed front door, stairs to first floor, under 
stairs cupboard, radiator and Amtico flooring. 
 

Cloakroom 

Frosted window to front, low level WC, pedestal hand 
wash basin with mixer tap and splash back, radiator 
and Amtico flooring. 
 

Living Room 

11' 5" x 16' 2" max ( 3.48m x 4.93m max ) 

Window to front, TV point, radiator and carpeted 
flooring. 
 

Kitchen/Diner 

15'  max x 19' 9" max ( 4.57m max x 6.02m max ) 

Window and French doors to rear, wall and base 
units with roll top work surfaces, stainless steel sink 
with drainer and mixer tap, integrated fridge freezer 
and dish washer, double electric oven with gas hob 
and extractor, spotlights, radiator and Amtico 
flooring. 
 

Utility 

5' 4" x 7' 6" ( 1.63m x 2.29m ) 

Window to side, wall and base units with roll top 
worksurfaces, space for fridge and washing machine, 
radiator and Amtico flooring. 
 

Landing 

Access to loft, airing cupboard, radiator and carpeted 
flooring. 
 

Bedroom One 

13'  max x 9' 6" max ( 3.96m max x 2.90m max ) 

Window to front, TV point, radiator, built in wardrobe 
and carpeted flooring. 
 

En-Suite 

Frosted window to side, shower cubicle, pedestal 
hand wash basin with mixer tap, low level WC, spot 
light, extractor fan, part tiled walls, shavers socket, 
heated towel rail and Amtico flooring. 
 

Bedroom Two 

11' 2" x 9' 1" ( 3.40m x 2.77m ) 

Window to rear, radiator and carpeted flooring. 
 

Bedroom Three 

10' 4" x 7' 10" ( 3.15m x 2.39m ) 

Window to rear, radiator and carpeted flooring. 
 

Bedroom Four 

10'  max x 9' 2" max ( 3.05m max x 2.79m max ) 

Window to front, radiator and carpeted flooring. 
 

Family Bathroom 

Frosted window to side, panelled bath with shower 
attachment over and screen, pedestal hand wash 
basin with mixer tap, back to wall WC, spot light, 
extractor fan, part tiled walls, shavers socket, heated 
towel rail and Amtico flooring. 
 

Rear Garden 



 

 

 

 

 

 

1. MONEY LAUNDERING REGULATIONS Intending purchasers will be asked to produce identification documentation at a later stage and we 

would ask for your co-operation in order that there is no delay in agreeing the sale. 2. These particulars do not constitute part or all of an offer 

or contract. 3. The measurements indicated are supplied for guidance only and as such must be considered incorrect. Potential buyers are 

advised to recheck measurements before committing to any expense. 4. We have not tested any apparatus, equipment, fixtures or services and 

it is in the buyers interest to check the working condition of any appliances. 5. Where an EPC, or a Home Report (Scotland only) is held for this 

property, it is available for inspection at the branch by appointment. If you require a printed version of a Home Report, you will need to pay a 

reasonable production charge reflecting printing and other costs. 6. We are not able to offer an opinion either written or verbal on the content 

of these reports and this must be obtained from your legal representative. 7. Whilst we take care in preparing these reports, a buyer should 

ensure that his/her legal representative confirms as soon as possible all matters relating to title including the extent and boundaries of the 

property and other important matters before exchange of contracts. 

William H Brown  is a trading name of Sequence (UK) Limited which is registered in England and Wales under company number 4268443, Registered Office is Cumbria 

House, 16-20 Hockliffe Street, Leighton Buzzard, Bedfordshire, LU7 1GN.  VAT Registration Number is 500 2481 05.   
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welcome to 

Bere Road, Elmswell Bury St. Edmunds 

• Four Bed Detached Family Home 

• Downstairs Cloakroom, En-Suite & Family Bathroom 

• Open Plan Kitchen / Dining Room 

• Immaculately Presented 

• Generous Rear Garden With Decking Area 
 

Tenure: Freehold EPC Rating: B 
 

 

 

guide price  

£375,000 
 

 

 

 

 

 

Please note the marker reflects the 

postcode not the actual property 

   

Property Ref: 

SMK104310 - 0006 

 

view this property online  williamhbrown.co.uk/Property/SMK104310 

 

 


