
28 Ravenscroft, Swindon
Swindon


£325,000



28 Ravenscroft
Swindon, Swindon

Delightful two-bed semi-detached
bungalow in Covingham. Features
spacious bedrooms, shower room,
large living room, open plan kitchen
diner, conservatory, garage, driveway.
Convenient location near schools,
shops, A419 for easy commuting. Ideal
for comfortable, connected living.

Council Tax band: C

Tenure: Freehold



SEMI-DETACHED BUNGALOW

TWO BEDROOMS

AMPLE DRIVEWAY PARKING

FRONT AND REAR GARDENS

LARGE LIVING ROOM

NO ONWARD CHAIN

EXTENDED



McFarlane Sales & Lettings are
delighted to present this well
appointed 2-bedroom semi-detached
bungalow, nestled in the heart of
Covingham. The bungalow boasts two
generously sized double bedrooms, a
shower room, a large living room, and
an open plan kitchen diner. The
property also offers a conservatory
room leading out to a well maintained
rear garden. Additional features
include a garage and driveway
parking, offering convenience and
ample storage. Situated close to local
schools, shops, and excellent transport
links, including easy access to the
A419, this bungalow is ideally
positioned for a comfortable and
connected lifestyle.




