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2 Down Gate
ALRESFORD, HAMPSHIRE, SO24 9JB

Guide Price £650,000

●Well-Presented Family House

● Quiet Cul-de-Sac in Popular Residential Area

● Kitchen/Breakfast Room & Garden/Dining Room

● Four Bedrooms, Two Bath/Shower Rooms, Cloakroom

● Tandem Length Garage and Driveway Parking

● Attractive Rear Garden

A well-presented four bedroom family home, located in a quiet
cul-de-sac in a popular residential area, about a 15 minute walk to
the town centre. The property has a light and airy feel, with a
large sitting room, a through kitchen/breakfast room and a
spacious garden/dining room. There is good driveway parking, an
attractive rear garden, and a long tandem length garage, which
offers scope for further accommodation, subject to planning and
building regs approval.

The house is approached via a path to the front door, which
opens to the entrance hall. There is an understairs cupboard and
stairs leading up to the first floor, a cloakroom and small utility
room. Glazed double doors open to the generously proportioned
sitting room, which features French doors to the garden and a fire
surround with a wood-burning stove. The kitchen features a range
of fitted units and drawers, with solid wood worktops and a
breakfast bar. A wide opening leads through to the garden/dining
room, with French doors to the garage and a further door to the
garage.

On the landing, an airing cupboard houses the hot water cylinder.
The main bedroom has wall-to-wall built-in wardrobes and its own
en-suite shower room, with a white suite. Bedrooms 2 and 3 are
both double rooms, with views over the garden.



Bedroom 4 is used as a study, and has fitted oak furniture. The
family bathroom has a white suite, which includes a P-shaped
shower/bath.

There is access to the rear garden on the right hand side of the
house. A path to the left of the house allows access to a door in
the side of the garage. A paved seating terrace adjoins the rear of
the house, with steps leading up to the main part of the garden,
which is laid to lawn with flower & shrub borders. Further steps
lead up to a raised level, where there is a greenhouse.

Alresford is a beautiful Georgian town known for its variety of
independent shops, restaurants and inns located in stunning
surroundings on the edge of the South Downs National Park.
Attractions include the Watercress steam railway, schools for
infant, junior and secondary education, several churches and an
active and inclusive community. Highlights in the calendar include
the annual Watercress Festival in May and the Agricultural Show in
September. The cathedral city of Winchester is about 7 miles away
and there is easy access to the south coast, the midlands and
London via the road network. There is also mainline rail access to
London from both Winchester and Alton. Southampton airport is
only about half an hour away by car.

SERVICES
We understand that mains gas, electricity, water and drainage are
connected.

LOCAL AUTHORITY INFORMATION
Winchester City Council
Council Tax Band: F

DIRECTIONS
From our office in the centre of Alresford proceed down West
Street and, at the junction at the bottom of the hill, turn left into
Jacklyns Lane. Go under the railway bridge, up the hill and down
the other side and then take the first turn on the left into Linnets
Road. Turn right into Down Gate where No.2 is the second house
on the left hand side. 




