


46 Thurcroft Drive
£215,000 4 1 2



This four-bedroom semi-detached dormer bungalow combines 
modern living with practical features, all situated in a prime location, 
making it an ideal choice for your next home. This beautifully 
presented four-bedroom semi-detached dormer bungalow offers an 
inviting blend of comfort and practicality. This property is perfect for 
families, professionals, or anyone looking for a versatile living space 
in a sought-after area.

Step inside to a welcoming entrance hall that sets the tone for the 
rest of the home.

The heart of the home is a bright and spacious living room, designed 
for relaxation and entertaining, offering a warm, inviting atmosphere.

 At the rear, you will find a good-sized, recently fitted kitchen, 
complete with a range of modern base and wall units. This well-
equipped kitchen is perfect for culinary enthusiasts and everyday 
family meals.

The adjoining conservatory offers an additional living space that is 
usable year-round, thanks to its wood burner, which enhances the 
warmth and comfort during colder months. This area connects 
seamlessly to the garden, making it an ideal spot for relaxation or 
gatherings with friends and family.

The ground floor also boasts two bedrooms, one of which is 
currently being utilized as a home office one as a dining room your 
providing flexibility and  your lifestyle needs.

 Ascend to the first floor to discover two generously sized double 
bedrooms and a small single room, which is currently being used as 
a dressing room. 

The master suite enjoys lovely views over the garden and features 
fitted wardrobes, providing ample storage without compromising 
floor space.

The second double bedroom includes a front-facing window and 
also benefits from fitted wardrobes.

Completing the first floor is a modern, newly fitted shower room that 



• SEMI DETACHED HOUSE

• LIVING ROOM, KITCHEN

• GARAGE

• ENCLOSED REAR GARDEN

• FOUR BEDROOMS

• DRIVEWAY PARKING

• RESIDENTIAL LOCATION

• CONSERVATORY LOG 
BURNER


