
Park Street, London
SW6



Park Street, London 
, SW6

£800 Per Week 

ONLINE VIDEO available for this truly
stunning two-bedroom apartment which offers
high quality accommodation 656sqft/60.9sqm
which has been interior designed with luxury
furnishings and redecorated to throughout to
make the property truly special. The internal
layout comprises of an open plan lounge,
kitchen area, access to a balcony, two bedrooms
& bathroom. The idyllic canal side development
which was built by the renowned Berkeley St
George offers On-site a resident’s gym,
swimming pool, spa and 24-hour concierge.
Chelsea Creek is located nearby to Imperial
Wharf Overground station and Fulham
Broadway Underground station both offering
excellent links around London as well as the
famous Kings Road which offers a wide range
of designer boutiques, top class restaurants,
bars, and quaint cafes.

Council Tax - London Borough Of
Hammersmith & Fulham – Band G
Deposit 5 Weeks 
Tenancy 12 Months 

EPC - B (87)

• Stunning Two Bedroom Apartment

• High Specification Luxury Furniture

• 656sqft (60.9sqm)

• Interior Design

• Open Plan Modern Kitchen

• Balcony

• 24 Hour Concierge

• Residents Spa – Swimming pool &
Gymnasium

• Imperial Wharf Station 0.1m, Fulham Broadway
Underground 0.6m

• EPC - B (87)

11 Park Street
Chelsea Creek
London
SW6 2FS

Sales +44 (0) 20 7824 7090
paul@gartonjones.com
www.gartonjones.com

EPC certificate available on request.






