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Hendersons welcome you to this beautifully renovated four-
bedroom townhouse, situated in the highly sought-after Esk
Terrace, Whitby. This elegant property has been finished to an
exceptional standard, offering a perfect blend of contemporary
style and classic charm. Built in 1860 and lived in by a members
of the Brown family from 1886 through to 1993, this property is
steeped in History and a local resident talked fondly of Joe
Brown cooking Yorkshire puddings on the original Collier &
Sons range oven, which is still in situ today.

Inside, you’ll find spacious living areas filled with natural light,
modern fixtures, and high-quality finishes throughout. Each
bedroom is generously sized, providing comfort and versatility
for family living or hosting guests. The fully updated kitchen and
bathroom add a touch of luxury, while retaining a warm, inviting
atmosphere. It should be noted that both the kitchen and
bathroom where completed by stringers of Whitby, who have a
great reputation for quality.

The property benefits from a private parking space, a rarity in
this desirable location, and boasts stunning views over Whitby
Harbour and the picturesque town beyond. Whether you’re
enjoying the sights from the comfort of your home or taking a
short walk to the bustling harbour, this is an ideal location to
experience everything Whitby has to offer.

Unique Townhouse
5 Bedrooms
Central location
Garden
Period Features
Bespoke Kitchen & Bathroom by Stringers of Whitby
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