
Stones Road, Epsom



Guide Price £700,000

• No ongoing chain

• Extended detached bungalow

• Cul de sac location

• Scope to formalise loft space into living space

• Central Epsom location

• 29ft kitchen/dining room

• 25ft x 16ft vaulted reception room

• Family bathroom and ensuite

• Off street parking for two cars

• Underfloor heating throughout

Freehold

Offered to the market with no ongoing chain, this well
positioned extended and detached bungalow benefits from a
number of updates by the current owner, an abundance of
natural light and is just a short walk from the town centre and
railway station which is approximately 0.5 miles away.

The well designed accommodation provides the perfect layout
for modern living with defined reception areas that seamlessly
flow in to each other in a modern open plan layout, perfect for
entertaining, social occasions and most importantly, day to day
life.

The property itself has had many upgrades over recent years,
including underfloor heating, and coupled with the generous
space it provides and the numerous stand out features that
genuinely deliver that wow factor, finding a more impressive
and versatile detached home, within this price point, will be a
very difficult task indeed.

Sole agent. Call to view.

From the useful enclosed porch there is a welcoming entrance
hallway that leads you into the 29ft kitchen/dining room. From
there, double doors open onto the 25ft x 16ft reception room
complete with three skylights to really let light flood into the
space making it the real hub of the home.

There are three genuine double bedrooms with the principal
benefitting from a four piece ensuite, the remaining bedrooms
are service by a contemporary family bathroom.

Further noteworthy points to mention include a rear garden
accessed via the bifolds in the living room or via the side access
and a frontage that provides a driveway with off street parking
for two cars.

The need to view this property to fully appreciate the wonderful
position and opportunity it offers cannot be overlooked as at
first glance you simply cannot appreciate its offerings, once
inside the flexible layout as well as the further potential it offers
to formalise the loft space into living space will make you think
more than twice about securing this home.

The property is set within a highly requested and rarely
available residential area, and enjoys an excellent position. It is
ideally located for easy access to the high street and railway
station, both being just a short walk away. Within the closer
surrounding area is the Rainbow leisure centre and gym,
Sainsburys, several public houses and excellent road links to the
A24, A3 and A217 as well as regular bus links.

Due to the high level of interest that we expect in this property
we are recommending immediate inspection to fully appreciate
the position and accommodation. 

Call today to arrange your viewing.

Tenure - Freehold
Council tax band - D










