
Howden Green, Steventon, OX13 6FY
Guide Price £425,000 Freehold



The Property
Located in the peaceful village of Steventon, this modern
three-bedroom home offers practical and comfortable living.
The spacious reception room provides a welcoming space,
while the kitchen is sleek and functional. The master bedroom
benefits from an en-suite, offering added convenience.
Outside, the private garden is a peaceful retreat, complete
with a newly built timber garage and a separate insulated
study with power and internet—perfect for home working or
leisure. The property is well-positioned, with easy access to
Abingdon and the surrounding countryside.



Key Features
Spacious reception room perfect for entertaining

Stylish kitchen with contemporary appliances

Sleek family bathroom with modern finishes

Private garden ideal for a young family

Recently added timber garage and insulated study

Perfect blend of countryside living and convenience

Mainline rail links from Didcot Parkway

EPC Rating B - Council Tax Band D

The Location
Steventon is a charming and historic village nestled in the
heart of Oxfordshire. Surrounded by picturesque countryside,
it offers a peaceful rural lifestyle while maintaining excellent
connections to nearby towns such as Abingdon and Didcot.
The village boasts a welcoming community, a selection of
traditional pubs, and a rich history, with its iconic Causeway
and beautiful parish church. With convenient access to the
A34 and mainline rail links from Didcot Parkway, Steventon is
ideally located for commuters and those seeking a balance of
village charm and modern convenience.
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Thomas Merrifield and their clients give notice that:

1. They are not authorised to make or give any

representations or warranties in relation to the property either

here or elsewhere, either on their own behalf or on behalf of

their client or otherwise. They assume no responsibility for

any statement that may be made in these particulars. These

particulars do not form any part of any offer or contract and

must not be relied upon as statements or representations of

fact.

2. Any areas, measurements or distances are approximate.

The text, photographs and plans are for guidance only and

are not necessarily comprehensive. It should not be assumed

that the property has all necessary planning, building

regulation or other consents and Thomas Merrifield have not

tested any services, equipment or facilities. Purchasers must

satisfy themselves by inspection or otherwise.


