
Sandringham Road, South Gosforth NE3 1PY



This three bedroom upper floor 'Tyneside' flat is
ideally located on the west backing side of
Sandringham Road, South Gosforth. Sandringham
Road, situated a stones-throw from South
Gosforth Metro Station, The Brandling Villa and
within walking distance distance from Gosforth's
High Street with its new cafe culture, this property
offers a perfect purchase opportunity for a range
of buyers. 

Well presented throughout, the accommodation
briefly comprises: entrance hall with stairs to first
floor landing; lounge with feature fire; kitchen with
vaulted ceiling together with two sky lights, a range
of fitted units, work surfaces and rear door access
to the yard; centralised bathroom complete with
three piece suite; three bedrooms, all with fitted
wardrobe storage. Externally, a private west facing
yard with wall boundaries and roller shutter door
access to the rear service lane. Early viewings are
advised! 

Upper Floor 'Tyneside' Flat | 805 Sq ft (74.8m2) |
Three Bedrooms | Lounge | Kitchen with Vaulted
Ceiling | Bathroom | Private West Facing Rear
Yard | Well Presented | Leasehold - Tyneside
Lease with Peppercorn Rent | Council Tax Band A
| EPC:D

Offers Over £210,000


