
Salters Close, Gosforth NE3 5BW



With a west facing rear garden and no onward
chain! This two bedroom end-terrace home is
ideally located on Salters Close, Garden Village.
Salters Close, a quiet cul-de-sac is perfectly placed
to provide access to local shops including both the
ASDA and M&S stores, transport links via Regent
Centre Metro Service, local bus routes, schooling
and the shops, cafes and restaurants on Gosforth
High Street.

The accommodation briefly comprises: entrance
hall with stairs to first floor; 23ft living space with
feature fireplace, under-stairs storage cupboard,
bay window and French doors leading out to the
rear garden; kitchen with fitted units and work
surfaces. The first floor landing with storage
cupboard gives access to; two double bedrooms,
both with fitted wardrobe storage; bathroom
complete with three piece suite. Externally, a west
facing garden laid to block paving with fenced
boundaries and gated access to the rear service
lane. Recently refurbished, early viewings are
advised.

Two Bedroom Mid-Terrace | 606 Sq ft (56.3m2)
| 23ft Living Space | Kitchen | Bathroom | West
Facing Rear Garden | GCH & DG | Popular
Location | No Onward Chain | Freehold |
Council Tax Band B | EPC: C

Offers Over £175,000


